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Specifications

— Google Chrome 7.0 or a more current version of Google Chrome should be installed.

— If the Internet access is via a proxy-server, please make sure with your system administrator
that you are allowed to access the site https://procurement.lukoil-international.com/

- In order to ensure the possibility of working with PDF-documents you need Adobe Acrobat
Reader 6.0 or a more current version.

— For viewing graphics the most current version of Java Runtime Environment (Sun Java JRE)
is needed (for viewing Java Applets).

— You need to add *.lukoil-international.com to the list of Intranet Sites of the Internet-
browser.

Note: when working in the SRM system you cannot use the forward and backward navigation
buttons. You can only use the SRM system buttons.

Step 1. Login
I Important
Make sure that *.lukoil-international.com site is added to the list of "local intranet sites” of your

browser (Tools -> Internet Options -> Security -> Local Intranet -> Sites -> Advanced)

To enter the system type https://procurement.lukoil-international.com/ in the address bar.
On the appeared screen type in the user name and password and click "Log on".

G-SRM

Supplier Relationship Management

systom

Lew it SSIESS

Pagared® swenes|

Logon Proiemra® ot Sapacd \

;

Step 2. Viewing the Request for proposal
2.1.Viewing the list of Request for proposal

For viewing the list of available Requests for proposal (2), go to the "RFx" tab (1). To update the
information in the list, click "Refresh” (3).
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Welcome John Good

=) L

Ouverview

===y
—

fduanced Search

RFx

Active Queries

eRFxs All(50) Published (171 Ended (01 Completed (07

eRFxs - All
[» Show Guick Criteria Maintenance | 3
2 wigsny: |[Standard Yiew] [=] | [ creste Responze | | [ Displey Evert | Disply Response | | [ Print Previes | |i| Refresh |iExp0n 4]
B Event Mumker Event Description Evert Type Event Stat‘us 1 Smeisswon Drealine Responss Mumber Response Status
[ 2100000145 MOWIKOYSY 18102011 1004521 Request for proposal Published 2711201 3000000304 Acceptedd
[ 2100000144 U_PURCHASER 17.10.2011 Test services Reguest for proposal Publizhed 18.01.20M2 2000000303 Acceptedd
[ 2100000143 U_PURCHASER 14.10.2011 TecT Requsster Reguest for proposal Published FOT2M2 Mo Bid Created
2100000142 car Renuest for proposal Publizhed 2011.2011 3000000301 Accepted
Fields' description
Field Example Comment
Event Number 2100000128 Request for proposal system number
Event Description Car Text description of Request for proposal
Submission deadline | 25.12.2011 Date of making final decisions
Response Number If the bid is submitted, the field will show the
bid number.
Response Status No Bid Created Submitted — the bid for the Request for

proposal was submitted, bids with this status
are available for review by the purchaser and
participate in the winner selection

Saved - the bid for the Request for proposal
was saved, bids with this status are not
available for review by the purchaser and will
not participate in the winner selection

No Bid Created — no bid for the Request for
proposal was created

2.2.Viewing the information about the Request for proposal
For detailed viewing and getting information about the Request for proposal terms, click on the
Event number in the list.

RFx Home

Overview

RFx

Active Queries
eRFxs All(1) Published (171 Ended (00 Completed (07

eRFzxs - All

[» Show Quick Criteria Mairtenance |

Vi |[Standard View] [+] | [ Creste Responss | | [ Display Evert || Display Responsze | | [ Prinit Preview | | [ Retresh || Export 4 |
E. Ewvent Mumber ( Event Description Event Type Event Status Submizzion Deadling Response Mumber Response Status
2100000128 Cars Recuest for proposal Published 25122011 3000000285 Saved

2.2.1. Viewing general information about the Request for proposal

For viewing the general information about the Request for proposal, go to the "RFx Information™
(1) tab.
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Notes and Attachments

/| RFX Information I’1 tems

C 9
RFx Parameters Questions Note and Attachments Terms and Conditions

RFx Number: 2100000613

Purchasing Organization: |Procurement LME

Time Zone: UTC-5

Submission Deadline: * | 26.11.2016 21:00:00
Opening Date: * 28.11.2016 06:00:00
Terms of payment: 0001 100% during 30 days after delivery

End of Binding Period: 25.02.2017

Currency: UsD

w Partners and Delivery Information

I Details |-3 Send E-Mail || Ca

Function
2. . Delivery basis

The tab consists of several blocks:

a) "RFx Parameters' (1) Block

Number Name

LME

Includes general information about the Request for proposal.

Field Example Comment
Time Zone UTC-5 Time belt of the Request for proposal holders,
according to which time and dates are specified
Submission deadline 25.12.2011 | Deadline for bids' submittal
Opening Date 26.12.2011 | Date, when the purchaser will be able to see the
information on the submitted bids
End of Binding Period 26.02.2012 | Bid validity
Currency uUSD Currency, which will be used for the submitted bids
evaluation
Terms of payment 100% Payment Terms
during 30
days after
delivery
Delivery basis DAP/DDP | Delivery basis
West Qurna
2, Republic
of Irag

For viewing the detailed information about the delivery basis, click on "Delivery basis" line (2)
in "Partners and Delivery information™ Block and then click "Details" (3).
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Details of Delivery basis =E
Partner Details
Pame: [DaPDDR West Gurma 2, F [LUKGIL MID- EAST Ud. |
Departiment: I:l
Floor / Room: [ i |
Street f House Mumber: [Piict Campe Il |
Postal Code / City: | | [Basran, wiest Qurna 2 cof
District: L 1
PO, B [
Country: Irac|
Region: -
Phone Mumber/Phaone Extension: [+971 4 4487575 I[ |
Fax Mumber/Fax Extension: [+971 4 a4a 7511 I |
Eva
b) "Questions™ Block (2)
Includes qualification questions.
RFX Information ” tems Notes and Attachments
‘ RFx I Questi I Note and | Terms and Conditions
Question 2 Reply Comment

Date of delivery: *

Do you have IS0 9000 Sertificate?: * Yes No
2.2.2. Viewing the list of purchased goods/services

For viewing the list of purchased goods/services, go to "Items™ tab.

RFX Information | Items ‘I Notes and Attachments

'w ltem Overview B

dd Line [ cut ][ copy |[ Paste . |[ Detete Expand All Collapse Al Fiter Seftings Hide Outine | _
Line Number  fem Type FullDescription Description Product Category Quantty  Unit Currency Deivery Date Notes Attachments Total Value
« ool Material 121" Notebook 12.1 intel Core IS 4GB RAM 300GB SATA ( Laptop Lenovo x201 1.14.01 14 5T 17.102014 1 0

7200RPM) HardDrive, 8X DVD+/-RW Drive, win 7 pro.
10/100/1000 Mbps Gigabi Ethernet\Wireless LAN 802.1 In
Wireless Bluetooth 3.0 Russian/English KeyboardPrimary 6-cell
Battery 65W AC AdaptorWarranty: 3 Years Basic Carry Case

For exporting description of materials into the xlIs- file press the «Export items to Excel» button.

T 1
Close Register | | Questions and Answers ( 0 )l [ Export ems to Excel

RFXinformation " Htems | Notes and Attachments
w ttem Overview Ij
Add Line || Add Subline . [[{-}[ZE] cut ][ cony |[ Paste . || Detete Expand All Collapse Al Filler Seftings Hide Outine |
Line Number e Type Full Description Description Product Category Quantty Unit Currency Deivery Date Notes  Attachments Total Valie ||
+ @000l Materal 12.1" Notebook 12.1 Intel Core i 4GB RAM 300GB SATA ( aptop Lenovo x201 1.14.01 14 ST 17.102014 1 [

7200RPM) HardDrive, 8X DVD+/-RW Drive, win 7 pro.
10/100/1000 Mbps Gigab# EthernetWireless LAN 802.1 In

2.2.3. Viewing purchasing documentation

For viewing the purchaser information, attached to the Request for proposal, go to "Notes and

Attachments™ tab.

This tab includes:

e Purchaser's notes (*'Notes™ Block (1). For viewing it, click the link in the "Category"
column;

e Attached documents (“*Attachments™ Block) (2). For viewing it, click the link in the
"Description™ column,
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[Refresh | | [Register | [ Questions and Answers (07 |

RFX Information ©  fems | Hotes and Attachments |

[ o . ][ Clear
Aszigned To Category Text Presvies
Document Header  Tencering text Diear Sirs,

¥ Aftachments

Add Attachment || Edit Descrigption || ersioning Delete || Creste Gualification Profile
Azsigned To Category Description File Matne
Document Header Standard Attachment Contract Contract.coc

Step 3. Registration for participation in Request for proposal

Note: this step is done if you are registered in the System and see the published Request for
proposal, but were not invited to participate by e-mail.

In order to register for participation in the Request for proposal, click the "Register” button in the
RFx form.

RFx Number 2100000513 RFX Status Published RFx Start Date
RFx Version Number RFx Version Type Active Wersion

Close Refresh [ Register || Questions and Answers (0 ) | [ Export tems tc
RFX Information |’ tems [\ Notes and Attachments

RFx Parameters Questions Mote and Attachments Terms and Conditions.

RFx Number: 2100000613

Purchasing Organization: |Procurement LME

Time Zone: UTC-5

Submission Deadline: * | 25.11.2018 21:00:00
Opening Date: * 28.11.2016 06:00:00

Step 4. Informing the purchaser about the intention to participate in the Request
for proposal

In order to inform the purchaser about the intention to participate or not to participate in the
Request for proposal, use buttons "Participate”, "Do not participate™ or "Tentative".

| Close | | Refresh | I| Farticipate || Do Not Participate || Tentative |i Create Response || Questions and Answers (0 ) |

RFX Information |’ ktems | MNotes and Attachments

| RFx F s Q i Note and Att Terms and Conditions

RFx Number: 2100000613

Purchasing Organization: |Precurement LME

Time Zone: uTC-5

Submission Deadline: * | 26.11.2016 21:00:00
Opening Date: * 28.11.2016 05:00:00

Note: Decision on participation or non-participation can be changed until the "Submission
Deadline" occurrence.

Step 5. Bid preparation
5.1.Response creation

Note: this step is done if you were invited by e-mail or have registered in the System for
participation in the Request for proposal.
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To create response, click the "Create Response” button in the RFx form.

[ciose| | [Refresh| | [Do Not Participate | [ Tentative [ Create Response || Questions and Answers (0} |

'I!'F}{Infnrmaﬁnnl’ tems |  MNotes and Aftachments

| RFx Parameters | Questions | MNote and Attachments | Terms and Conditions

RFx Number: 2100000813
Purchasing Organization: | Procurement LME

Time Zone: UTC-5

5.2.Agreement with the tender terms

Read the DISCLAIMER carefully. In the event of agreement with the Request terms, put the

"Agree" tick.

| Submit | | Read Only || Print Preview | | Save (without Submit) \| Questions and Answers (0 ) \

l!FxIlrfnrmaﬁunl’ Notes and Attachments =~ tems | Summary -~  Tracking

| Basic Data | Questions | Notes and | Terms and Condit

DISCLAIMER: By submitting its commercial offer the Bidder hereby agrees with and acknowledges the following: 1.4 Contract is awa
commercial bid that will have been submitted to the Company by the Submission Deadline. 2. The Company retaing a right# - to reject a
cancel this Tender/Request for quotation at any time prior to the Submission Deadline or any time thereafter#without sharing any justi
undertaking any responsibility or liability to a Bidder. 3. A Bidder has reviewed a draft of the Contract prepared by the Company, whic
preferred Bidder, and uncenditionally agrees on it. 4. The Bidder's access to the SRM system may be blocked by the Company forap
years, if# - a Bidder has made any corrections or amendments to a commercial bid in the SRM system after the Submission Deadline,
commercial bid (partialty or entirely) at any stage after the Submission Deadline, o - has failed to sign a Contract in seven (7) calend
original copy signed by the Company #5. Noetwithstanding anything te the contrary herein or in our previous correspondence on the s
shall be deemed accepted by LUKOIL Mid-East Limited (the "Company™), and no contract shall be deemed to have been entered into br
a formal bilateral written instrument shall be duly signed by the Company's representative duly authorized for this purpose. 6. A Comn

Event Parameters

Currency: United States Dollar

5.3.Answers to questions

Go to "Questions" tab, answer the questions, add your comments if applicable.

'Rﬁ(lwfnmnﬁonr Notes and Attachments © tems ;| Summary © Tracking

BasicData | Questions | MNotes and Attachments | Terms and Conditions.

Question Reply Comment

Date of defivery: ™ Fg|

Do you have IS0 9000 Sertificate?: * @ Yes O No I:l
Have you read all attached documents? @ ¥es (“No (7 NoReply

5.4.Addition of mandatory documents

Go to "Notes and attachments" tab in the section «Attachment to be submitted by bidder».

RFxlnfnrmaﬁnn” Notes and Attachments | ftems © Summary ©  Tracking

Basic Data | Questions I Notes and Attachments II Terms and Conditions

w Notes
Clear
Category Description
RFx/Auction Text -Empty-
Bidder's Remarks -Empty-
Purchaser's Bemarks -Empty-

See the document template in the Sample column (in case it was added) (1).
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w Attachment to be submitted by bidder

Change File Selection 1 File source A/Z

Drescription Requirement Sample

test I imagelD1.png I Add File Source

For addition of the file press «Add file source» (2).
For change of the added file press «Change file selectiony.

w Attachment to be submitted by bi

I Change File Selection I
Diescription Requirement Sample File source
test image001.png image001—{1} png

I Important:
- add only files which are relevant to each particular document which was requested

5.5.  Agreement with the contest terms

Go to «Terms and Conditionsy tab and put «Agree» thick opposite all terms.

RFx i r Notes and [ tems [ Summary ~ Tracking

Basic Data | Questions | Notes and Attachments I Terms and Conditions

| accept all Contract Draft terms and conditions. Agree

Commercial offer is valid for 90 days from submission deadine date. Agree

5.6.  Price specification
To specify the price, go to the "Items" tab. In the "Price" field enter the price for each item.

To enter prices for service item you should first expand node (1) or press to the “Expand All”
button (2) and enter prices. To hide nodes and show only items press the “Hide Outline” button.

[ e ForTyps  Procuat Catsgory  Procust Comgor Descpion Redurod sy Suonted Gty Unt res Cureacy Do
o s cuna ome som : 1o uso
s sonee o i i matsu

I Important:

- the price is specified per unit of product;

- the price should be inclusive of taxes and charges;

- if you do not specify the item price - you are offering the item for free.

AFx nformatizn | Nnkﬂlnuhh{nmenhl Htems. 'Isz—y Trackng
— a

<o 1 =
Lo umoer  Basorpton FutBescrpton Aoavgun fomType Protuc Clogery  roduc Catagry sscrbéon Rocured Qusnly _ Subited Gusntty rancy DobvoryDsta  Toalveun A/ Ressenes [ R Response 5]
- (@000 LeplopLe... 121" Nolsbook 12.1 el Core © 4GB RAM 300GE SATA (T200RPM) [ Asd ansngus Hateial — " ool tooilso  onimimzm tamen we pre)
HardErice, B DVDeL Deue, win T pro. 101001000 Uips Gigont

Emrameiveess LAN 512.1 1 Visess SUstboth 3.0 RussiSnERQisn
A Sty S 2 Venrs Basi 2

Fiber Expand All Colapsz Al Hide Dusine Setings

Cary Cass.

Total Vsiue | 1400000 | usD

The total value - (Price * Submitted Quantity) is calculated automatically (3).
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5.7.  Specifying the possibility of supplying analogues

The System stipulates the possibility to provide the information on provision of analogues.

In the "Items" tab (1) on the «Analogue» column, click «Add analogue» button (2) on the item
position, for which it is necessary to enter the information about the analogues.

Edit RFx Response 3000000646 Hep
WX Responss Number 0U0G4E  RPKWUmber 2100000 SWla Saved  Submigsion Dsoing 3012Z013ZICLO0UTC  Remaining Time 70va1003  RFxOwner M.FURCHASERFIEl  RFXResponse Varsion NUMDST ACIVEVErSon  RFEVeraion NumDer AZHve
Suenit |[chse | | [Read Onty || print Preview | | [ chect || Save wineut suomty || Detete | | questions ana answers (03 |
v temOverview 1 -
oD T o Fier Expand Al Colapse Al Fide Outine
Liva Number  Descripton  Full Bescription & FemTypa Product Calagory  Product Catagory Descrbfon  Requied Qusnify  Submied Ouantfy Unk Price Cumency DolveryDsta  Toislvale AFx/Resgonse | RFx/Responce )
- EH0015) LopiopLe . 121" Nolebook 12.1 el Core & 450 RAM 30063 SATA ( T200REM) vt Hatesinl Compsrduwsre Worisls " 14ST J00OIUSE  OnTADZOM 1400000 gp 0
HordDrive, 8X VD +/-RW Drive, win T pro. 10100/1003 Nbps Gigaat 2
A 8021 n 10 Russi
GNAC ears Dusic
Cary Case

5.7.1 Entering information on analogues.

You should specify only one possible analogue per item and its price in the field Price.
I Important: If you specify several analogues per item this item will not be considered.

Add Analogue

Analogue: 12,5" Lenovo ThinkPad X230 NZALBRT

{125 LED " TFT / 1366X768 / Intel® Core™ i3 / 3120M /
2500 / Intel@ HD 4000 (shared) / 4098 Mb / 500 Gb /
Windows 7 Pro 64-bit + Windows 8 Pro 64-bit / 1.5 kg /

Black

Click “Ok™:
Information about analogue will be available for viewing and editing in «Analogue» column.

Edit RFx Response 3000000646

Afx Response Number 3000000048 RfxMumber 2100000388 Ststus Saved  Submission Desdiine 30 122013210000 UTCA  Remaining Time 780sys 100600 AFx Owner bt PURCHASER Frst

RFx Response Version Humber Achve ersion

RFx Version fumber Azt

(St O | | [end Oy | [PrinPrevie | | [heet ] | Bekte | [Guesions |
AFxwomaten | Hos and Atacrmerts < Hems | Summary © Trockng

v tem Overview =

(Bemsls | = Frar Expand Al Colapse Al e Dutne Serngs

MemTyps  Froduct Calegary  Froduct Calegory Descrioion  Requied Quanlly  Submlled Qusliy Unk Prce Curency DefweryDale  TolalVas AFx)Response [ Rfic/ Response &)
14ST 100, USB  OnTADIOM 1400000 Op 10

Ansogus
125" Lenove ThintPad X230 NZALBRTE 125 LED " TFT/

Live Muribsr  Descriplion  Full Descrigbion

« E0O0TZ] Lapop Le . 121 Notsbook 12.1 kel Core & 4G8 RAM 3008 SATA { 200RFM) iorenmi

Comptardware WorkSla .

HardDrive, BX OVE-RA Grtvo, win T pro. 10401009 Wspa Ggait 13BETER | nleit Corer™ (31 1201 1 3500 J ofolf HO 4
LEN 8026 In i (shared] | 4096 b,/ 500 Gb | Windowes 7 Pro 8-
G5 AC. venrs naic || sunsows o oo sa-be 11 Sy sBinc

Carry Case.

Step 6. Filling a bid

| Submit || Close |

[ Read Only | [ Print Preview | || Save (without Subm) | [ Questions and Answers (0] |

2

RFx Information |’ Notes and Attachments

tems

Summary | Tracking

‘ Basic Data | Questions | Notesand Attachments | Terms and Conditions

DISCLAIMER: By submitting its commercial offer the Bidder hereby agrees with and acknowledges the following: 1.A Contract is awarded to a Bidder with the best
commercial bid that will have been submitted o the Company by the Submission Deadline. 2 The Company retains a right# - to reject any bid from any Bidder, or# -
cancel this Tender/Request for quotation at any time prior to the Submission Deadline or any time sharing any for its decisions and
undertaking any responsibility or liability to a Bidder. 3. A Bidder has reviewed a draft of the Contract prepared by the Company, which is to be signed with the
preferred Bidder, and unconditionally agrees on it. 4. The Bidder's access to the SRM system may be blocked by the Company for a period of 3 months and up to 3
years, if¥ - a Bidder has made any corrections or amendments to a commercial bid in the SRM system after the Submission Deadline, oré##- has withdrawn its
commercial bid (partially or entirety) at any stage after the Submission Deadline, or# - has failed to sign a Contract in seven (7) calendar days upon receipt of the
ariginal copy signed by the Company #5. Notwithstanding anything to the contrary hersin or in our previous correspondence on the subject mattsr hersof, no bid
shall be deemed accepted by LUKOIL Mid-East Limited (the "Company”), and no contract shall be deemed to have been entered into by the Company, unless and until
a formal bilateral written instrument shall be duly signed by the Company’s representative duly authorized for this purpose. 6. A Commercial bid shall be submitted on

Agres
Event Parameters
End of Binding Period. 23022017

Currency: United States Dollar

Check the bid by clicking the "Check™ (1) button. If errors were made while filling out the bid,
the system will show a relevant error message. Correct the errors and reiterate the check.
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For submitting the bid, click the **Submit™ (2) button.

I Important: For saving the bid without sending it to the buyer, click the "Save (without
Submit)" button.

If submittal was successful, the System will show the message on the bid registration.
RFxX response 3XXXXXXXXX submitted
Changing the submitted bid

You can edit the data of your bid until the "Submission Deadline” occurrence.
For editing the bid, select the required response from the list.

RFx Home:
Querview
RFx

Active Queries
eRFxs Al(1) Published (17) Ended (0) Completed (0

eRFxs - All

[ ¥ Showr Quick Criteria Mairtenance |

Wigwe: |[Standard View] [~] | [ Create Response | | | Display Evert || Display Response | | | Prirt Preview | | | Refresh |[ Export « |
EL  Event hNumher Event Description Event Type Event Status Submigsion Desdline Response Numi{ Response Status
21000001 28 Cars Request for proposal Published 2512201 3000000285 Saved

In the bid form click the "Edit" button.

Display Document: 3000000285

RFx Response Humber 3000000235 Status Saved Submission Deadline 26.12.2011 00:00:00 RUS03 Remaining Time &6 Days 12:56:01
Nynnse Version Humber Active Wersion RFx Wersion Humber Active '

yr RFxIrrfurma‘(iunI’ ftems ~  MNotes and Attachmerts ~ Summary © Tracking

Basic Data | GQuestions | Motes and Attachments

DISCLAIMER: Company will award the cortract based on the best commercial ofter received by closing time for submitting
offers as may be decided by the Company by ts sole discretion. Company reserves the right to reject any offer from any
Bidcler without explanstion of ressoni-=) and without any responsibilty or lisbilty whatsoever against such Bidder. Company

After entering changes, click the ""Submit™ button.

After submitting the bid you can track the request status in the RFx list. In case of acceptance or
rejection of your bid, you will receive a notification to the e-mail address, specified during
registration process.

INPAY YOUR ATTENTION TO THE FACT THAT YOU HAVE SUBMITTED YOUR

RESPONSE OTHERWISE IT WILL NOT BE SENT TO THE BUYER

Active Queries

eRFxs All(23) Published (1) Ended (0) Completed (0}

eRFxs - All

¥ Show Guick Criteria Mantenance

View: [[Standard View] [=] | [ create Response | [ Display Event || Display Response | || Print Preview | || Refresh | Export s

EL  Event Number Event Description Event Type Event Status. Submission Deadiine Response Number Response Status. Event Version
2100000258 Apple IPad and Diary Reguest for proposal Published 24092012 3000000521 ISubmm:d I
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